
Testimonies From PBC 2017

I've been a born again christian for approximately 35 years. My spiritual life had 
taken a 'hit' so to speak for a number of years now.  Your PBC class re-awak-
ened my spirit to what was still possible.  I thought my spiritual experiences were 
in the past. I was wrong.  I still have some territory to take, and look forward to 
Holy Spirit helping me through more of the things I need to get rid of, or include 
back into my spiritual life and for even more growth. I've enjoyed the classes 
greatly and pray that I can take what I've received and use it for God's glory!  
Many thanks and blessings to Trese for her commitment to the ministry and all 
the students in her classes. Leslie 

I would say that the first thing that comes to mind is the total sense of freedom 
that I felt building with each week.  It was truly wonderful to be able to feel so 
safe and free to do whatever Holy Spirit moved us to do.  Your book really helped
me to understand so much more of the prophetic than from others I have read.  I 
believe your personal stories helped to break down any barriers we may have 
had.  Not to mention your actual teaching.  I learned and took to heart such 
things as discipline, which I knew I needed, but that little nudge did it for me.  I 
am much more circumspect about what I'm thinking, and that my heart stays up 
and not under in negativity. Helping me to ask God to set a watch over my mouth
and guard the door of my lips. I have a much better sense of what prophecy is, 
and is not.  I'm trying to work on delivery, when I feel I receive something.  But it 
will always be to build up, encourage and comfort.  I've learned to be more 
aware, when someone speaks over me as well.  Trese, I don't know how you 
packed it all in, but you did, and it was done with such grace, firmness and you 
are funny!!!  I am so very glad I that I yielded to God and took the class.  I truly 
didn't realize that God had me where He wanted me.  I thought I decided to take 
the class.  But I soon learned He put me with the person I needed to learn from.  
Sharon M.

Thinking of how the last couple months at your PBC classes have really opened 
my eyes and heart to a whole new world in the prophetic. Although, I've spoken 
words over people in the past while praying for them, the class just really made a
lot of things more clearly for me. I love the book; will read it again and take it all in
again. I love the class, because it does feel like a place of safety as you are there
to train us as we slowly take everything in and get a chance to branch out into 
this new area for us working with us as a safety net to help us as we branch out. I
love to see how you minister the freedom that you walk in and really that you 
know and are so happy to be in your calling and are so sensitive to the sound of 
the fathers voice; love it! It's really been a life changer for me I don't think I fully 
know right now how much but I'm so glad I attended. Thanks so much for giving 
so much of yourself !  Sharon S.



I've come a long way since the beginning of this class. From skipping the very 
first class because of fearing the unknown. To now looking forward to class each 
week, because each week I know that I'm becoming more mature. There is so 
much that I've learned from this training.  One of the major things that I'm taking 
away from this is that delivery of the message is just as important as the mes-
sage itself. I'll always remember that! Maddy

This truly has been one of the best classes I have ever taken. The inspiration and
spiritual uplift that has taken over my life has been unprecedented. I never could 
have imagined how equally yoke my wife and I are and have become, through 
taking this class together. My eyes have been open to see the beautiful visions 
that our Father has blessed me with, my ears have been opened to hear his 
words, my mouth have been opened to speak the knowledge that he has be-
stowed upon me, and my heart has been open to receive the most wonderful gift 
of all his Holy Spirit. What a wonderful journey this has been a total life changer, 
from a timid man, to singing a song that he blessed me with in front of my broth-
ers and sister in Christ . Can't Waite to see what he has in store for my family 
and I in the years to come . A truly unforgettable experience for me and my fami-
ly…. Luis R. Sr.

First of all, what a pleasure...Training is so important, something I've desired for 
years.  From the age of eighteen I've come to know about and desired the 
prophetic and to be trained in this area.  Everything this class had to offer has 
confirmed all God has placed in me.  And being around like minds has enhanced 
my desire even more to walk out my destiny with a better understanding.  You 
asked me before the class started if I knew that I had a prophetic gift and I an-
swered, "yes".  But what I needed was to be stretched beyond what I knew within
myself and to be enlightened in more of what God knew I needed;  guidance.  
You've done that! Thank you for being obedient to hear from the Lord. Forever 
grateful! Joselyn

My testimony for being in Power Boot Camp has been nothing less than an extra-
ordinary Holy Spirit experience that has given me a new found love and fire for 
seeing the Lord’s people with different eyes. It has encouraged me to develop a 
MUCH deeper relationship with the Holy Spirit. I must add that I have been able 
to truly trust for the first time in a long time. Narcisa

I learned how to listen and hear from HOLY SPIRIT- how to not doubt myself so 
much- I’ve acquired a greater understanding of the deeper meanings and ways 
of GOD! Tammy 


